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RESOLUTION 2024-29

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO AWARD A BID TO SWOP4G FOR
HIGHWAY ROCK SALT.

WHEREAS, the City has participated in a co-operative bidding process for highway rock salt; and

WHEREAS, Council and Staff recommend SWOP4G as the lowest and best bidder for the above-
mentioned item.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF POWELL, COUNTY OF DELAWARE,
STATE OF OHIO, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: That Council hereby awards the bid for highway rock salt to SWOP4G and authorizes
the City Manager to enter into a contract on behalf of the City for the purpose of purchasing highway rock
salt for the 2022-2023 winter season.

Section 2: Itis hereby found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and
relating to the passage of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of Council and that all
deliberations of Council and any of the decision-making bodies of the City of Powell which resulted in such
formal actions were in meetings open to the public in compliance with all legal requirements of the City of
Powell, Delaware County, Ohio.

4 Sectign 3: This Resolution shall be in full force and effect immediately upon adoption.

Tom Counts ~— IDafe laine McCloskey
Mayor City Clerk
EFFECTIVE DATE: August6, 2024 This legislation has been posted in accqrdance with the

City-Gharter on this date wrd B 1 P24
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City

City Council
Tom Counts, Mayor
Leif Carlson David Lester Christina Drummond Heather Karr Ferzan Ahmed Tyler Herrmann






ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB

SEASON 2024-2025

Lowest Bid
Delivered price
Pick-up price
Item P American Rock Salt | Cargill [ Compass Minerals Morton Salt
No. Qreaviration Total Tons _[Delivered Price [Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price | Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price
1 [Batavia Township 700 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06 $85.06 $8407 $81.00 $84.09 $80.00
2 [Bath Township 300 $81.42 $75.00 $63.57 $61.57 $82.54 $81.00 $83.47 $80.00
3 [Beavercreek Township 1,000 $84.91 $75.00 $62.63 $60.63 $86.16 $81.00 $86.19 $80.00
4 [Beavercreek, City of 3,000 58491 $75.00 $61.60 $59.60 $86.16 $81.00 $86.19 $80.00
5 |Bellbrook, City of 400 $84.91 $75.00 $6234 $6034 $86.89 $81.00 385.01 $80.00
6 |Bexley, City of 100 STL11 $75.00 $61.54 $59.54 $71.98 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
7 |Blendon Township 500 $71.30 $75.00 $61.35 $5935 $71.81 $68.00 NOBID NO BID
8 |Blue Ash, City of 2,500 $92.76 $75.00 $86.27 58427 $8423 381.00 $86.21 $80.00
9 [Brookville, City of 300 $86.38 $75.00 $65.11 $63.11 $82.88 $81.00 $80.31 $80.00
10 |Butler Township 1,500 $84.91 $75.00 $6463 $62.63 $83.28 $81.00 $8423 $80.00
11 [Caesarscreek Township 300 §73.92 $75.00 $61.88 $59.88 $81.43 $81.00 NOBID NO BID
12 [Cardington, Village of 75 $72.42 $75.00 $59.89 $57.89 $68.64 $68.00 $69.44 $70.00
13 [Cedarville, Village of 200 $79.81 $75.00 $60.81 $58.81 $81.33 $81.00 $83.14 $80.00
14 [Central Ohio Transit Authority 600 S7L11 $75.00 $61.07 $59.07 $72.01 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
15 [Clayton, City of 700 No Bid No Bid $65.19 $63.19 $82.55 $81.00 $83.83 $80.00
16 |Clermont County Engineer’s Office 1.500 No Bid No Bid $87.27 $85.27 38424 $81.00 $84.26 $80.00
17 [Clinton Township 100 $71.17 $75.00 $61.07 $50.07 §72.34 568.00 NO BID NO BID
18 [Concord Township 750 $72.73 $75.00 $60.35 $5835 $69.14 568.00 NOBID NO BID
19 [Dayton Public Schools 150 $83.09 $75.00 $6521 $63.21 $82.89 $81.00 $83.83 $80.00
20 [Dayton, City of 4,000 $86.38 $75.00 $63.40 $61.40 $82.99 $81.00 $83.93 $80.00
21 |Dublin, City of 2,000 No Bid No Bid $61.38 $5938 $70.09 $68.00 NOBID NO BID
22 |Englewood, City of 1,200 $84.91 $75.00 $64.98 $62.98 $81.42 $81.00 $85.09 $80.00
23 |Evendale, Village of 400 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96 $82.96 58539 $81.00 $87.39 $80.00
24 [Fairborn, City of 1,600 $81.42 $75.00 $63.38 36138 38257 $81.00 $83.51 $80.00
25 |Fammersville, Village of 50 $87.83 $75.00 $65.27 $6327 $83.28 $81.00 $8331 $80.00
26 |Gahanna, City of 2,800 $71.98 $75.00 $61.44 $59.44 $71.26 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
27 |Genoa Township 400 $71.85 $75.00 $60.69 $58.69 $71.20 $68.00 §71.22 $70.00
28 |Germantown, City of 400 $92.49 $75.00 $65.17 $63.17 $84.19 $81.00 $8422 $80.00
29 [German Township 250 $87.83 $75.00 $64.79 $6279 $82.83 $81.00 $83.77 $80.00
30 [Gilead Township 200 $79.81 $75.00 $60.22 $5822 $67.92 $68.00 $68.72 $70.00
31 |Glendale, Village of 300 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96 $82.96 $86.25 $81.00 $8827 $80.00
32 |Goshen Township 600 $88.05 $75.00 $87.69 $85.69 $87.98 $81.00 $90.05 $80.00
33 |Grandview Heights, City of 500 $71.17 $75.00 $60.74 $5874 $71.57 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
34 |Greene County Engineer 7,500 $83.09 $75.00 $62.07 $60.07 $82.57 $81.00 $83.51 $80.00
35 |Hamilton, City of 3,000 $92.76 $75.00 $66.84 $64.84 $83.97 $81.00 $85.94 $80.00
36 |Harlem Township 300 $7235 $75.00 $60.25 $5825 $70.28 $68.00 $71.87 $70.00
37 |Harrison Township 1,000 $84.00 $75.00 $64.45 36245 $82.63 $81.00 $83.56 $80.00
38 [Hilliard, City of 1,500 $72.30 $75.00 $60.87 $58.87 $72.39 $68.00 NOBID NO BID
39 |Huber Heights, City of 3,000 $81.42 $75.00 $6430 $62.30 $83.35 $81.00 $84.29 $80.00
40 [Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 $92.76 $75.00 $67.59 $65.59 $84.23 $81.00 $86.21 $80.00
41 [Jackson Township 100 $87.83 $75.00 $64.92 $62.92 $82.58 $81.00 $83.52 $80.00
42 , Village of 60 $81.42 $75.00 $63.51 $61.51 $82.55 $81.00 $8439 $80.00
43 [Jefferson Township 400 $83.09 $75.00 $65.44 $63.44 $82.66 $81.00 $83.59 $80.00
44 [Kettering, City of 5,500 No Bid No Bid $63.66 $61.66 $83.17 $81.00 $84.12 $80.00
45 [Mad River Local Schools 50 $83.09 $75.00 $65.55 $6355 $83.10 $81.00 $84.04 $80.00
46 |Mason, City of 5,500 $88.05 $75.00 $63.15 $61.15 $85.42 $81.00 387.43 $80.00
47 [Miami County Engineers Office 6,000 $86.38 $75.00 $62.68 $60.68 $74.34 $67.00 NO BID NO BID
48 [Miami Township (Clermont County) 1,500 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06 $85.06 $8423 $81.00 586.21 $80.00
49 [Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,000 387.83 $75.00 $64.65 $62.65 $82.98 $81.00 $83.01 $80.00
50 [Miamisburg, City of 3,000 $87.83 $75.00 $63.00 $61.00 $83.36 $81.00 $83.38 $80.00
51 [Middletown, City of 3,500 $92.76 $75.00 $69.34 $67.34 $86.26 $81.00 $88.29 $80.00
52 [Milford, City of 7501 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06 $85.06 $86.81 $81.00 3$88.85 $80.00
53 [Monroe, City of 3,000 388.05 $75.00 $87.21 $85.21 $87.12 $81.00 $89.17 $80.00
54 |Montgomery County Engineer's Office 10,000 $86.37 $75.00 $64.34 $62.34 $82.59 3$81.00 $83.53 $80.00
55 [Montgomery County Parks 150 $86.38 $75.00 364.84 $62.84 $82.97 $81.00 $83.00 $80.00
56 [Moraine, City of 1,500 $86.38 $75.00 $63.70 $61.70 $82.43 $81.00 $8336 $80.00
57 |Mt Gilead, Village of 100 $71.42 $75.00 $59.90 $57.90 $67.92 $68.00 $68.72 $70.00
58 |New Calisle, City of 300 $77.07 $75.00 $61.56 $59.56 $83.26 $81.00 NOBID NO BID
59 |New Jasper Township 400 $81.42 $75.00 $63.60 $61.60 $82.55 $81.00 $83.48 $80.00
60 [Oakwood, City of 900 $86.38 $75.00 $63.97 $61.97 $83.35 $81.00 $83.37 $80.00
61 |Obetz, City of 300 57130 $75.00 $66.45 $64.45 $72.49 $68.00 NOBID NO BID
62 |Perry Township (Franklin County) 400 $71.35 $75.00 $60.93 $58.93 $72.36 $68.00 NOBID NOBID
63 [Pierce Township 1,000 59431 $75.00 $86.26 $84.26 $85.52 $81.00 $87.53 $80.00
64 [Piqua, City of 2,500 $87.83 $75.00 $64.48 $62.48 $73.70 $67.00 NO BID NO BID
65 |Powell, City of 1,500 $70.85 $75.00 $60.71 $58.71 $70.61 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
66 |Riverside, City of 3,000 $83.09 $75.00 36432 $62.32 $82.55 $81.00 $83.48 $80.00
67 ille, City of 1,500 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96 $82.96 $84.53 $81.00 S81.73 $80.00




68 [Sidney, City of 1,200 $92.76 $75.00 $62.98 $60.98 $7473 $67.00 NO BID NOBID
69 St Benard, Village of 600 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96 $82.96 38182 $81.00 $81.84 380.00
70 [Stonelick Township Board of Trustees 50 $9276 $75.00 3$87.06 $85.06 $84.07 $81.00 $84.09 $80.00
71 |Sugarcreek Township 1,500 $77.60 $75.00 $62.53 56053 $81.17 $81.00 57865 $80.00
72 |Tate Township (Clermont County OH) 150 $92.76 $75.00 $87.69 $85.69 $85.20 $81.00 $85.22 $80.00
73 |Trenton, City of 500 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06 $85.06 $88.43 $81.00 $90.51 $80.00
74 [Trotwood, City of 2,000 $86.38 $75.00 S64.12 $62.12 $83.06 $81.00 $84.01 $80.00
75 |Troy, City of 500 $86.36 $75.00 $62.12 $60.12 $76.05 $67.00 $80.39 $80.00
76 |Union Township Trustees 2,400 $92.76 $75.00 58538 $83.38 8158 $81.00 $79.84 $80.00
77 |Union, City of 600 $84.91 $75.00 $65.20 $63.20 $81.65 $81.00 NO BID NOBID
78 |Upper Arlington, City of 1,000 No Bid No Bid 36153 $59.53 $70.79 $68.00 NO BID NOBID
79 [Vandalia, City of 2,000 $83.09 $75.00 $64.66 $62.66 $81.38 $81.00 NO BID NO BID
80 |Washington Township (Montgomery County OH) 2,500 $86.38 $75.00 $64.04 $62.04 $83.28 $81.00 38423 $80.00
81 |Washington Township (Clermont County) 40 $97.26 $75.00 $87.69 $85.69 38424 $81.00 $84.26 $80.00
82 |West Carrollton, City of 1,200 $86.38 $75.00 563.94 361.94 $83.12 $81.00 $83.15 $80.00
83 |West Jefferson, Village of 400 §7285 $75.00 36229 36029 $73.16 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
84 [West Milton, Municipality of 325 $86.38 $75.00 $65.09 $63.09 $77.78 $67.00 NO BID NO BID
85 |Whitehall, City of 3,000 S71.67 $75.00 561,51 $59.51 S7L13 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
86 |Williamsburg Township 120 $92.76 $75.00 $88.92 $86.92 $85.20 581.00 $85.22 $80.00
87 |Woodlawn OH, Village of 600 $92.76 $75.00 $65.44 3634 $85.39 $81.00 $87.39 $80.00
88 |Worthington, City of 2,000 $71.30 $75.00 361.51 $59.51 $70.01 $68.00 NO BID NO BID
89 |WrightPatterson AFB 2,100 No Bid NoBid NOBID NO BID No Bid No Bid $86.99 380,00
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications
90 [Xenia, City of 1,500 $83.09 $75.00 $62.01 $60.01 $85.33 $81.00 $85.36 $80.00
91 |Xenia Township 800 s81.42 $75.00 363.23 $61.23 $82.69 $81.00 $83.54 $80.00
92 [Yellow Springs, Village of 300 $81.42 $75.00 NOBID NOBID $83.50 $81.00 NOBID NO BID




ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB

SEASON 2025-2026

Lowest Bid
[petivered price
[Pick-up price
Item | _ American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt
No. Total Tons _[Delivered Price [Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price
1 [Batavia Township $97.39 $78.00 $97.06 $95.06 $91.07 $88.00 $86.62 $82.00
2 [Bath Township 300 38549 $78.00 $73.57 $71.57 $89.54 $88.00 $85.98 $82.00
3 [Beavercreek Township 1,100} $89.16 $78.00 $7263 $70.63 $93.16 $88.00 $88.77 $82.00
4 |Beavercreek, City of 3,000 $89.16 $78.00 $71.60 $69.60 $93.16 $88.00 $88.77 $82.00
5 [Bellbrook, City of 400 $89.16 $78.00 37234 $70.34 $93.89 $88.00 $87.56 $82.00
6 [Bexley, City of 100] $74.66 $78.00 $7154 $69.54 $78.98 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
7 [Blendon Township 500) $74.86 $78.00 $7135 $69.35 $78.81 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
8 [Blue Ash, City of 2,500) $97.39 $78.00 $96.27 $94.27 $91.23 $88.00 $88.80 $82.00
9 [Brookville, City of 300] $90.69 $78.00 $75.11 $7311 $89.88 $88.00 $82.72 $82.00
10 |Butler Township 1,500 $89.16 $78.00 $7463 $7263 $90.28 $88.00 $86.72 $82.00
11 [Caesarscreek Township 300 $77.61 $78.00 $71.88 $69 88 $88.43 $88.00 NOBID NO BID
12 |Cardington, Village of 75 $76.04 $78.00 369 89 $67.89 $75.64 $75.00 $71.52 $72.00
13 |Cedarville, Village of 200 $83.80 $78.00 $70.81 $68.81 $88.33 $88.00 $85.64 $82.00
14 |Central Ohio Transit Authority 600 $74.66 $78.00 $71.07 $69.07 $79.01 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
15 |Clayton, City of 700 No Bid No Bid $75.19 $73.19 $89.55 $88.00 $86.35 $82.00
16 [Clermont County Engineer’s Office 1.500 No Bid No Bid $97.27 $95.27 $91.24 $88.00 $86.79 38200
17 [Clinton Township 200 $74.73 $78.00 $71.07 $69.07 $79.34 $75.00 NOBID NO BID
18 [Concord Township 750 $76.37 $78.00 $70.35 $68.35 $76.14 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
19 [Dayton Public Schools 150 $87.24 $78.00 $75.21 $7321 $89.89 $88.00 386.35 $82.00
20 [Dayton, City of 4,000 $90.69 $78.00 $73.40 $71.40 $89.99 $88.00 $86.45 $82.00
21 |Dublin, City of 2,000 No Bid No Bid $71.38 $69.38 $77.09 $75.00 NOBID NO BID
22 [Engl , City of 1,200 $89.16 $78.00 $74.98 $72.98 $88.42 $88.00 $87.64 $82.00
23 dale, Village of 400 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96 $92.96 $92.39 $88.00 $90.01 $82.00
24 [Fairbomn, City of will re-evaluate] $85.49 $78.00 $73.38 $7138 $89.57 3$88.00 $86.01 $82.00
25 [Farmersville, Village of 50 $92.22 $78.00 $75.27 $73.27 $90.28 $88.00 $85.81 $82.00
26 |Gahanna, City of 2,800 $75.58 $78.00 $71.44 $69.44 $78.26 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
27 |Genoa Township 400 §75.44 $78.00 $70.69 $68 69 $78.20 $75.00 $73.35 $72.00
28 |Germantown, City of 400/ $97.12 $78.00 $75.17 $73.17 $91.19 $88.00 $86.75 $82.00
29 |German Township 250 $92.22 $78.00 $74.79 $72.79 $89.83 $88.00 $86.28 $82.00
30 |Gilead Township 200 $83.80 $78.00 $70.22 $68.22 $74.92 $75.00 $70.78 $72.00
31 [Glendale, Village of 300 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96 $92.96 $93.25 $88.00 $90.92 $82.00
32 |Goshen Township 600 $92.45 $78.00 $97.69 $95.69 $91.98 $88.00 $92.75 $82.00
33 |Grandview Heights, City of 500 $74.73 $78.00 $70.74 $68.74 $78.57 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
34 |Greene County Engineer 7,500 $87.24 $78.00 $72.07 $70.07 $89.57 $88.00 $86.01 $82.00
35 |Hamilton, City of 3,000 $97.39 $78.00 $76.84 $74.84 $90.97 $88.00 58852 $82.00
36 [Harlem Township 300 $75.96 $78.00 $70.25 $68.25 $77.28 $75.00 $74.03 $72.00
37 |Harrison Township 1,000 $88.20 $78.00 $74.45 $72.45 $89.63 $88.00 $86.07 $82.00
38 [Hilliard, City of 1,500 $75.91 $78.00 $70.87 $68.87 $79.39 $75.00 NOBID NO BID
39 |Huber Heights, City of 6,000 $85.49 $78.00 $74.30 $72.30 $90.35 $88.00 $36.82 $82.00
40 |Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 $97.39 $78.00 $77.59 $75.59 $91.23 3$88.00 $88.80 $82.00
41 [Jackson Township 100! $9222 $78.00 $74.92 $72.92 $89.58 $88.00 $86.02 $82.00
42 [Jamestown, Village of 100 $85.49 $78.00 $73.51 $71.51 $89.55 388.00 $86.92 $82.00
43 [Jefferson Township 400! $87.24 $78.00 $75.44 $73.44 $89.66 $88.00 $86.10 $82.00
44 |Kettering, City of 5,500 No Bid No Bid $73.66 371.66 $90.17 $88.00 $86.64 $82.00
45 |Mad River Local Schools 50| $87.24 $78.00 37555 $73.55 $90.10 $83.00 $86.56 $82.00
46 [Mason, City of 5,500 $92.45 $78.00 $73.15 $71.15 $92.42 5$88.00 $90.05 $82.00
47 [Miami County Engincers Office 6,000 $90.69 $78.00 $72.68 $70.68 $81.34 $74.00 NO BID NO BID
48 [Miami Township (Clermont County) 2,500 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06 $95.06 $91.23 $88.00 $88.80 $82.00
49 [Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,000 $92.22 $78.00 $7465 $7265 $89.98 $88.00 $85.50 $82.00
50 [Miamisburg, City of 3,000 59222 $78.00 $73.00 $71.00 $90.36 $88.00 $85.88 $82.00
51 [Middl City of 3,500 $97.39 $78.00 $79.34 $77.34 $93.26 $88.00 $90.94 $82.00
52 |Milford, City of 750 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06 $95.06 $93.81 $88.00 $91.52 $82.00
53 [Monroe, City of 3,000 $92.45 $78.00 $97.21 $95.21 $94.12 $88.00 $91.85 $82.00
54 [Montgomery County Engineer's Office 10,000 $90.69 $78.00 $74.34 $72.34 $89.59 $88.00 $86.03 $82.00
55 [Montgomery County Parks 150! $90.69 $78.00 $74.84 $72.84 $89.97 $88.00 $85.49 $82.00
56 |Moraine, City of 1,500 $90.69 $78.00 $73.70 $71.70 $89.43 $88.00 3$85.86 $82.00
57 |Mt Gilead, Village of 100 $74.99 $78.00 $69.90 $67.90 $74.92 $75.00 $70.78 $72.00
58 [New Carlisle, City of 300 $80.92 $78.00 $71.56 $69.56 $90.26 $88.00 NOBID NO BID
59 |New Jasper Township $85.49 $78.00 $73.60 $71.60 $89.55 $88.00 $85.99 $82.00
60 |Oakwood, City of 900 $90.69 $78.00 $73.97 $71.97 $90.35 $88.00 $85.88 $82.00
61 |Obetz, City of 300 $74.86 $78.00 $76.45 $74.45 §79.49 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
62 |Perry Township (Franklin County) 400 $74.91 $78.00 $70.93 $68.93 $79.36 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
63 [Pierce Township 1,000 $99.02 $78.00 $96.26 $94.26 $92.52 $88.00 $90.16 $82.00
64 [Piqua, City of 2,500 $9222 $78.00 $74.48 $72.48 $80.70 $74.00 NOBID NO BID
65 [Powell, City of 1,500 $74.39 $78.00 $70.71 $68.71 $77.61 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
66 |[Riverside, City of 3,000 $87.24 $78.00 $7432 $7232 $89.55 $88.00 $85.99 $82.00
67 [Sharonville, City of 1,500! $97.39 $78.00 $94.96 $92.96 $91.53 $88.00 $8418 $82.00




Sidney, City of 1,200 $97.39 578.00 $72.98 $70.98 8173 $74.00 NOBID NO BID
St. Bernard, Village of 600 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96 $92.96 388.82 $88.00 $8430 58200
0 [Stonelick Township Board of Trustees 75 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06 $95.06 391.07 $88.00 $86.62 $82.00
Sugarereek Township 1,500] S81.48 $78.00 $72.53 $70.53 $83.17 $88.00 $81.01 $82.00
Tate Township (Clermont County OH) 150 $97.39 378.00 $97.69 $95.69 $92.20 $88.00 $87.78 38200
Trenton, City of 500 597.39 $78.00 $97.06 $95.06 $95.43 $88.00 $93.22 $82.00
Trotwood, City of 2,000 $90.69 $78.00 $74.12 s72.12 $90.06 $88.00 $86.53 $82.00
Troy, City of 500 $90.68 $78.00 $72.12 $70.12 $83.05 $74.00 $82.80 $82.00
Union Township Trustees 2,400 $97.39 $78.00 595.38 $93.38 $88.58 $83.00 $8224 $82.00
Union, City of 600 $89.16 $78.00 $75.20 $73.20 $88.65 $88.00 NOBID NO BID
8 |Upper Arlington, City of 1,000 No Bid No Bid 57153 $69.53 $77.79 $75.00 NOBID NOBID
Vandalia, City of 2,000 $87.24 578.00 $74.66 $72.66 38338 $88.00 NOBID NO BID
‘Washington Township (Montgomery County OH) 2,500 $90.69 $78.00 $74.04 $72.04 590.28 388.00 $86.75 $82.00
1 |Washington Township (Clermont County) 40 $102.12 $78.00 $97.69 $95.69 $91.24 $88.00 $86.79 $82.00
West Carrollton, City of 1,200 $90.69 $78.00 $73.94 $71.94 $90.12 $88.00 38564 $82.00
West Jelferson, Village of 400 $76.49 $78.00 $7229 $70.29 $80.16 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
West Milton, Municipality of 350 $90.69 $78.00 $75.09 $73.09 $84.78 $74.00 NO BID NO BID
Whitchall, City of 3,000 $75.25 $78.00 $7151 $69.51 $78.13 $75.00 NO BID NO BID
Williamsburg Township 120 $9739 $78.00 $98.92 $96.92 $92.20 $88.00 $87.78 $82.00
Woodlawn OH, Village of 600 $97.39 $78.00 $75.44 $73.44 $92.39 388,00 $90.01 $82.00
Worthington, City of 2,000 $7486 $78.00 $7151 36951 $77.01 $75.00 NOBID NO BID
Wright-Patterson AFB 2,100 NoBid No Bid NOBID NOBID No Bid No Bid $89.60 3$82.00
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications
Xenia, City of 1,500 $87.24 $78.00 $7201 $70.01 $9233 $88.00 3$87.92 $82.00
Xenia Township 300 585.49 $78.00 $73.23 $71.23 $89.69 $88.00 $86.04 $82.00
2 |Yellow Springs, Village of 300 $85.49 $78.00 NOBID NOBID $90.50 3$88.00 NO BID NO BID




